
...the politicians and capital-
ists have put us in a situation 
of economic and environmen-
tal precarity. 

Yet on a global level, people 
are resisting and fighting for 
their freedom – from Egypt 
to Greece, and even in North 
America – with strikes, occu-
pations, riots, and revolutions. 

Here in Montréal, the tuition 
fee hikes are just one ex-
ample of the politicians and 
capitalists making us pay for 
their crisis, along with the ris-
ing costs of food, transit fare 
hikes, and social service cuts. 
They even discuss sucking 
two more years of work from 
us by increasing the retire-
ment age. 

Don’t be fooled into “shoul-
dering the burden”. These
measures only protect the in-
terests of the bosses.

Montréal: May Day demonstration

Egypt: anti-government protesters attack a riot police van

Greece: strike demonstration against austerity

CAPITALISM IS THE CRISIS!
LET’S STRUGGLE FOR LIFE AND FREEDOM, 

NOT FOR SURVIVAL!

All across the world

ANTI-CAPITALIST DEMONSTRATION
MAY 1st, 4:30 PM

Champ-de-Mars, 
(intersection of St-Antoine and Gosford)


